AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1B

Union Calendar No. 480
"2 H, R, 7056

[Report No. 119-558]

To index statutory thresholds, and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

JANUARY 14, 2026
Mr. BARR introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee
on Financial Services
MarcH 19, 2026
Additional sponsors: Mr. GOTTIIEIMER and Mr. MEUSER

Marcr 19, 2026
Reported with an amendment, committed to the Committee of the Whole
House on the State of the Union, and ordered to be printed
[Strike out all after the enacting clause and insert the part printed in italic]

[For text of introduced bill, see copy of bill as introduced on January 14, 2026]



2

A BILL

To index statutory thresholds, and for other purposes.

*HR 7056 RH



O o0 N N BB W =

|\ IR N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e T T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O B BN~ WD = O

3
Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “Community Bank Regu-
latory Tailoring Act”.
SEC. 2. THRESHOLD ADJUSTMENTS TO ACCOUNT FOR HIS-
TORICAL INCREASES IN CURRENT-DOLLAR
UNITED STATES GROSS DOMESTIC PRODUCT.
(a) BANK HOLDING COMPANY AcT OF 1956.—The
Bank Holding Company Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et
seq.) is amended—

(1) an  section 5(c)(3)(C)(in) (12 U.S.C.
1844(c)(3)(C) (1)), by striking “$1,000,000” and in-
serting “$3,000,000”’; and

(2) an  section 13(h)(1)(B)(x) (12 U.S.C.
1851(h)(1)(B)(1)), by striking “$10,000,000,000” and
mserting “$15,000,000,000”.

(b) COMMUNITY REINVESTMENT ACT OF 1977 —~Sec-
tion 809(a) of the Community Reinvestment Act of 1977
(12 U.S.C. 2908(a)) is amended by striking “$250,000,000”
and inserting “$800,000,000”.

(¢) DEPOSITORY INSTITUTION MANAGEMENT INTER-
LOCES Acr.—The Depository Institution Management

Interlocks Act (12 U.S.C. 3201 et seq.) 1s amended—

*HR 7056 RH



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

|\ T N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e T T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O B BN~ WD = ©

4
(1) wn section 202(4) (12 U.S.C. 3201(4)), by

striking “$100,000,000” and inserting
“$600,000,000;

(2) in section 203(1) (12 U.S.C. 3202(1)), by
striking “$50,000,000” and inserting “$110,000,0007;
and

(3) in section 204 (12 U.S.C. 3203)—

(A) by striking “$2,500,000,000” and in-
serting “$10,000,000,000”; and

(B) by striking “$1,500,000,000” and in-
serting “$10,000,000,000™.

(d) DODD-FRANK WALL STREET REFORM AND CON-

SUMER PrOTECTION ACT.—The Dodd-Frank Wall Street
Reform and Consumer Protection Act (12 U.S.C. 5301 et

seq.) is amended—

(1) in section 210 (12 U.S.C. 5390)—

(A) in  subsection (o), by  striking
“$50,000,000,000” in each place it appears and
mserting “$105,000,000,000”; and

(B) in  subsection (v), by striking
“$1,000,000” and inserting “$5,000,000’; and
(2) in section 956(f) (12 U.S.C. 5641(f), by

striking “$1,000,000,000” and mserting

“$3,000,000,000”.

*HR 7056 RH



5}
(¢) FEDERAL CREDIT UNION AcT.—The Federal Cred-

1t Union Aet (12 U.S.C. 1751 et seq.) is amended—

(1) in section 202 (12 U.S.C. 1782)—

(A) in subsection (a)(6)(C)(vir)—

(1) wn the heading, by striking “DE

MINIMUS” and inserting “DE MINIMIS™; and

(11) by striking “$10,000,000” and in-
serting “$34,000,0007;

(B) wn subsection (a)(6)(D)—

(1) by striking “$500,000,000” and in-
serting ““$2,000,000,000”’; and

(11) by striking “$10,000,000” and in-
serting “$34,000,000”;

(C) in subsection (b)(1)(A), by striking
“$50,000,000” each place that term appears and
mserting “$170,000,000”; and

(D) wn subsection (¢)(1)(A)(ii1), by striking
“$50,000,000” each place that term appears and
mserting “$170,000,000”’; and
(2) in section 216 (12 U.S8.C. 1790d)—

(A) an  subsection (f)(2), by striking
“$10,000,000” and inserting “$34,000,0007;

(B) in subsection (1)(4)(B), by striking

“$5,000,000” and inserting “$17,000,000”;

*HR 7056 RH



O© 00 3 O WD B W N -

[\© TN NG T NG T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O T NO I e

6
(C) an  subsection (j)(2)(A), by striking
“$25,000,000” and inserting “$51,000,000”’; and
(D) in  subsection (0)(4), by striking
“$10,000,000” and inserting “$34,000,0007.

(f) FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE ACT.—The Federal

Deposit Insurance Act (12 U.S.C. 1811 et seq.) 1s amend-

(1) in section 7(a)(12) (12 U.S.C. 1817(a)(12)),
by  striking  “$5,000,000,000”  and  inserting
“$8,000,000,000”;

(2) an  section 11(p)(1)(A)(1) (12 U.S.C.
1821(p)(1)(A)(v)), by striking “$1,000,000” and in-
serting “$5,000,0007;

(3) in section 36 (12 U.S.C. 1831m)—

(A) an  subsection (1), by  striking
“$5,000,000,000” each place that term appears
and nserting “$21,000,000,000”’; and

(B) in  subsection  (j), by  striking
“$150,000,000” each place that term appears
and inserting “$800,000,000”; and
(4) in section 38 (12 U.S.C. 18310)—

(4) in  subsection (b), by striking
“$300,000,000” and nserting “$2,000,000,000”;
and

(B) in subsection (k)—

*HR 7056 RH



7
(1) by striking “$50,000,000” and in-

[E—

serting “$110,000,000”; and
(11) by striking “$75,000,000” and in-
serting “$150,000,0007.
(9) FEDERAL HOME LOAN BANK AcT.—Section 2(10)
of the Federal Home Loan Bank Act (12 U.S.C. 1422(10))
1s amended by striking “$1,000,000,000” each place that

term appears and inserting “$.3,000,000,000”.

O o0 9 N U B W

(h) FEDERAL RESERVE AcT—The Federal Reserve

10 Aet (12 U.S.C. 221 et seq.) 1s amended—

11 (1) in section 7(a)(1) (12 U.S.C. 289) by strik-
12 g “$10,000,000,000” each place that term appears
13 and nserting “$17,000,000,000”; and

14 (2) an  section  22(h)(5)(C) (12 U.S.C.
15 375b(h)(5)(C)) by striking “$100,000,000” and insert-
16 ing “$500,000,000”,

17 (1) HOME MORTGAGE DISCLOSURE ACT OF 1975.—

18 The Home Mortgage Disclosure Act of 1975 (12 U.S.C. 2801

19 et seq.) is amended—

20 (1) in the second paragraph (3) of section 304(1)
21 (12 U.S.C. 2803(1)(3)); relating to “Exemption from
22 certarn  disclosure  requirements”), by  striking
23 “$30,000,000” and inserting “$160,000,000”; and

24 (2) in section 309(a) (12 U.S.C. 2808(a)), by
25 striking “$10,000,000” and inserting “$180,000,0007.

*HR 7056 RH



O o0 9 N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

8

(1)) HomE OWNERS’ LOAN AcT.—Section 5(u) of the

Home Owners’ Loan Act (12 U.S.C. 1464(u)) is amended—

(1) n  paragraph (2)(A)(x), by  striking
“$500,000” and inserting “$3,000,000”; and

(2) am  paragraph  (2)(A)(i1), by striking

“$30,000,000” and inserting “$160,000,000”.

(k) INTERNATIONAL LENDING SUPERVISION ACT OF
1983.—8ection 909(a)(1) of the International Lending Su-
pervision Act of 1983 (12 U.S.C. 3908(a)(1)) is amended
by striking “$20,000,000” and inserting “$160,000,000”.

(1) REAL ESTATE SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES ACT OF
1974.—RSection 3(1)(B)(iv) of the Real Estate Settlement
Procedures Act of 1974 (12 U.S.C. 2602(1)(B)(iv)) s
amended by  striking  “$1,000,000” and  inserting
“$19,000,000”.

(m) REVISED STATUTES OF THE UNITED STATES.—
Section 5136A(a)(2)(D)(11) of the Revised Statutes of the
Unated States (12 U.S.C. 24a(a)(2)(D)(11)) 1s amended by
striking “$50,000,000,000” and mserting
“$175,000,000,000".

(n) TruTH IN LENDING Acr—Section
129C()(2)(F)(i) of the Truth in Lending Act (15 U.S.C.
1639¢(D)(2)(F) (1)) 18 amended by striking

“$10,000,000,000” and inserting “$15,000,000,000”.

*HR 7056 RH



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

|\ T NG N N T NG I NG I N S N e T e e T e e e T
LN A W D= O O NN NN R W DY = O

9
SEC. 3. PERIODIC ADJUSTMENTS TO THRESHOLDS TO AC-

COUNT FOR FUTURE INCREASES IN CUR-
RENT-DOLLAR UNITED STATES GROSS DO-
MESTIC PRODUCT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—By April 1, 2031, and the 1st day
of each subsequent 5-year period, the Board of Governors
of the Federal Reserve System shall prescribe the amount
by which each dollar amount described in section 2 of this
Act shall be increased by the ratio, if greater than 1, of
the annual value of current-dollar United States gross do-
mestic product, published by the Department of Commerce,
Jor the calendar year preceding the year in which the ad-
Justment s calculated under this section, to the published
annual value of current-dollar Unaited States gross domestic
product for the calendar year preceding April 1, 2026.

The values used in

(b) CURRENCY OF INFORMATION.
the calculation under subsection (a) shall be, as of the date
of the calculation, the values most recently published by the
Department of Commerce.

(¢) ROUNDING.—

(1) If any amount equal to or greater than
$100,000,000,000 determined under subsection (a) for
any period is not a multiple of $50,000,000,000, the
amount shall be rounded wp to the nearest

$50,000,000,000.

*HR 7056 RH



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

10
(2) If any amount less than $100,000,000,000

but equal to or greater than $10,000,000,000 deter-
mined under subsection (a) for any period is not a
multiple of $5,000,000,000, the amount shall be
rounded up to the nearest $5,000,000,000.

(3) If any amount less than $10,000,000,000 but
equal to or greater than $1,000,000,000 determined
under subsection (a) for any period is not a multiple
of $500,000,000, the amount shall be rounded up to
the nearest $500,000,000.

(4) If any amount less than $1,000,000,000 but
equal to or greater than $100,000,000 determined
under subsection (a) for any period is not a multiple
of $50,000,000, the amount shall be rounded up to the
nearest $50,000,000.

(5) If any amount less than $100,000,000 but
equal to or greater than $10,000,000 determined
under subsection (a) for any period is not a multiple
of $5,000,000, the amount shall be rounded up to the
nearest $5,000,000.

(6) If any amount less than $10,000,000 but
equal to or greater than $1,000,000 determined under
subsection (a) for any period is not a multiple of
$500,000, the amount shall be rounded up to the

nearest $500,000.

*HR 7056 RH



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

24
25

11
(7) If any amount less than $1,000,000 but equal

to or greater than $100,000 determined under sub-
section (a) for any period 1is not a wmultiple of
$50,000, the amount shall be rounded up to the near-
est $50,000.

(8) If any amount less than $100,000 but equal
to or greater than $10,000 determined under sub-
section (a) for any period is not a multiple of $5,000,
the amount shall be rounded up to the nearest $5,000.

(9) If any amount less than $10,000 but equal
to or greater than $1,000 determined under subsection
(a) for any period is not a multiple of $500, the
amount shall be rounded up to the nearest $500.

(10) If any amount less than $1,000 but equal
to or greater than $100 determined under subsection
(a) for any period is not a wmultiple of $50, the
amount shall be rounded up to the nearest $50.

(11) If any amount less than $100 but equal to
or greater than $10 determined under subsection (a)
Jor any period is not a multiple of $5, the amount
shall be rounded up to the nearest $5.

(12) If any amount less than $10 but equal to
or greater than $1 determined under subsection (a)
Jor any period is not a multiple of $0.50, the amount

shall be rounded up to the nearest $0.50.

*HR 7056 RH



[E—

O o0 9 N U B W

12

(d) PUBLICATION.—Not later than April 5 of any cal-
endar year in which an adjustment is required to be cal-
culated under subsection (a), the Board of Governors of the
Federal Reserve System shall publish in the Federal Reg-
ister the dollar amounts as so calculated.

(¢) IMPLEMENTATION PERIOD.—The increase in the
dollar amounts shall take effect on January 1 of the year
immediately succeeding any calendar year in which an ad-

Jgustment s required to be calculated under subsection (a).

*HR 7056 RH






Union Calendar No. 480

11910 CONGRESS
2D SESSION :. zo qcma

[Report No. 119-558]

A BILL

To index statutory thresholds, and for other
purposes.

MarcH 19, 2026

Reported with an amendment, committed to the Com-
mittee of the Whole House on the State of the Union,
and ordered to be printed




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2026-03-19T21:59:21-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




